Event Details

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 1 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53:33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15: 00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
Event Description
An addendum has been posted to the Supplier Portal.
General Questions
\ Question UoM Best Worst Response
Does your organization meet the minimum requirements
outlined in Attachment J, Minimum Requirements
document? Please upload your completed Attachment J
and answer YES or NO here. If your answer is NO, then
your proposal will be disqualified and will not be
considered for award. Yes

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseiYes

Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment C - Indiana
Economic Impact form (in Excel format).

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo
A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.
Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment D - Cost
Proposal, Cost Proposal Narrative, and Cost
Assumptions, Conditions, and Constraints documents.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo
A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.
Response Comments

Please upload your completed Attachment E - Business
Proposal and any other pertinent attachments.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.
Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 2
Event Round Version

1 4

Event Name

RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services

Start Time Finish Time

08/ 25/ 2020 11:53:33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bid Number: 1

Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00

Response Comments

Bidder:

Submit To:

Contact:
Phone:
Email:

Neta Scientific Inc
4206 Sylon Blvd
Hainesport NJ 08036
United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Stephanie Nelson-00061

SteNelson@idoa.in.gov

Please upload your completed Attachment F - Technical
Proposal and any other pertinent attachments.

Required: Yes Mandatory ResponseNo

A file attachment is required to satisfy this question.

Your bid will need to be edited online to include attachment responses.

Response Comments




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 3 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15: 00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
Line Details
No Bid:
Line: 1 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: LAB CONSUMABLES - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 2 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: BIOLOGICALS, MICROBIOLOGY, AND MOLECULAR BIOLOGY SUPPLIES - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0

Required: Yes

Response Comments

Mandatory Response:

No




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 4 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/05/ 2020 15:00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
No Bid:
Line: 3 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: LAB EQUIPMENT, FURNITURE, AND STORAGE - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 4 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: LAB CHEMICALS - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 1
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 5 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: CHROMATOGRAPHY - TOTAL BID AMOUNT




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 5 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/05/ 2020 15:00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 1
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 6 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: LAB DIAGNOSTICS - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 7 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: LABWARE - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 1

Required: Yes

Response Comments

Mandatory Response:

No




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 6 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/05/ 2020 15:00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
No Bid:
Line: 8 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: LAB FILTRATION - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 1
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 9 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: SAFETY EQUIPMENT & CLOTHING - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 10 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: LAB INSTRUMENTS & UTENSILS - TOTAL BID AMOUNT




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 7 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/05/ 2020 15:00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 11  Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: TESTING EQUIPMENT & PARTICLE SIZING - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UOM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No
Response Comments
No Bid:
Line: 12 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1
Required: No Reserve Price: No
Description: SAMPLE COLLECTION & SHIPPING - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 8 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15: 00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
No Bid:

Line: 13 Item ID: Line Qty:  1.00 UOM: Each Bid Qty: 1

Required: No Reserve Price: No

Description: MICROSCOPES & ACCESSORIES - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Question UoM Best Worst Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0

Required: Yes Mandatory Response: No

Response Comments




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc

00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 9 4206 Sylon Bivd

Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036

1 4 United States

Event Name

RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration

Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15: 00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468

INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

Event Currency: US Dollar United States

Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061

Phone:

Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov

Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST

Total Bid Amount: 4.00
Bidder Information

Firm Name:

Name: Signature: Date:
Phone #:. Fax #:

Street Address:

City & State: Zip Code:

Email:




Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 10 4206 Sylon Blvd
Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036
1 4 United States
Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration
Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15:00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204
Event Currency: US Dollar United States
Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061
Phone:
Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00
Appendix C - Bid Responses
General Questions
Question Response
Does your organization meet the minimum
requirements outlined in Attachment J, Minimum
Requirements document? Please upload your
completed Attachment J and answer YES or NO here.
If your answer is NO, then your proposal will be
disqualified and will not be considered for award. Y
Please upload your completed Attachment C -
Indiana Economic Impact form (in Excel format).
Please upload your completed Attachment D - Cost
Proposal, Cost Proposal Narrative, and Cost
Assumptions, Conditions, and Constraints
documents.
Please upload your completed Attachment E -
Business Proposal and any other pertinent
attachments.
Please upload your completed Attachment F -
Technical Proposal and any other pertinent
attachments.
Line Iltems
Line: 1 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: LAB CONSUMABLES - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Line: 2 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: BIOLOGICALS, MICROBIOLOGY, AND MOLECULAR BIOLOGY SUPPLIES - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Line: 3 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:
Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: LAB EQUIPMENT, FURNITURE, AND STORAGE - TOTAL BID AMOUNT
Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page
00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 11

Event Round Version
1 4

Event Name
RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services

Start Time Finish Time
08/ 25/ 2020 11:53:33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15:00: 00 EST

Event Currency: US Dollar
Bids allowed in other currency: No

Bid Number: 1
Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST
Total Bid Amount: 4.00

Line: 4 Item ID: UOM: Each
Total Line Bid Amount: 1

Description: LAB CHEMICALS - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

LineQty: 1

Question Response

Bidder:

Submit To:

Contact:
Phone:
Email:

Neta Scientific Inc
4206 Sylon Blvd
Hainesport NJ 08036
United States

Administration

IDOA, Procurement Division

402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

United States

Stephanie Nelson-00061

SteNelson@idoa.in.gov

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price? 1
Line: 5 Item ID: UOM: Each
Total Line Bid Amount: 1
Description: CHROMATOGRAPHY - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

LineQty: 1

Question Response

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price? 1
Line: 6 Item ID: UOM: Each
Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: LAB DIAGNOSTICS - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

LineQty: 1

Question Response

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price? 0
Line: 7 Item ID: UOM: Each
Total Line Bid Amount: 1
Description: LABWARE - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

LineQty: 1

Question Response

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price? 1
Line: 8 Item ID: UOM: Each
Total Line Bid Amount: 1
Description: LAB FILTRATION - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

LineQty: 1

Question

Response

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price?

Line: 9

Item ID:
Total Line Bid Amount:

Line Qty:

1

UOM: Each

Description: SAFETY EQUIPMENT & CLOTHING - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Question

Response

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price?

Line: 10

Item ID:
Total Line Bid Amount:

Line Qty:

0

UOM: Each

Description: LAB INSTRUMENTS & UTENSILS - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Question

Response

Bid Qty:

What is your quote/bid price?

0



Event Details (cont.)

State of Indiana Request for Quotation

Event ID Format Type Page Bidder: Neta Scientific Inc

00061- 0000002633 Sel | RFx 12 4206 Sylon Blvd

Event Round Version Hainesport NJ 08036

1 4 United States

Event Name

RFP 21-2633 Laboratory Supplies & Rel ated Services Submit To: Administration

Start Time Finish Time IDOA, Procurement Division

08/ 25/ 2020 11:53: 33 EDT 11/ 05/ 2020 15: 00: 00 EST 402 W WASHINGTON ST RM W468
INDIANAPOLIS IN 46204

Event Currency: US Dollar United States

Bids allowed in other currency: No Contact: Stephanie Nelson-00061

Phone:

Bid Number: 1 Email: SteNelson@idoa.in.gov

Bid Date: 11/04/2020 11:37:39 EST

Total Bid Amount: 4.00

Line: 11  Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:

Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: TESTING EQUIPMENT & PARTICLE SIZING - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Line: 12 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:

Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: SAMPLE COLLECTION & SHIPPING - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Question Response
What is your quote/bid price? 0
Line: 13 Item ID: LineQty: 1 UOM: Each Bid Qty:

Total Line Bid Amount: 0
Description: MICROSCOPES & ACCESSORIES - TOTAL BID AMOUNT

Question Response

What is your quote/bid price? 0



